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About	the	Book

Success means different things to different people; to some success is not a 
one-way street but a constant journey, to another success can be an 
achievement or the amount of money you make or have in your bank account. 
Generally, when people think of success they usually think of material gains, 
happiness, and exploit. Agreed, success can include all of these things but it is 
not limited to the aforementioned.

Casey 'Gbenga Adeleye is a founding Trustee of the Empowered Mission for 
Christ Commission (EMCC), a Commission with a mission to preach the 
Gospel of our Lord and Saviour Jesus Christ and equip believers with the truth 
of God's Word while ful�illing their divine mandate more intelligently, 
passionately and responsibly.

Casey 'Gbenga Adeleye is a Social Activist, an Educator and Publisher of the 
Christian Magazine, Believers Today. He sits on the Boards of nationally and 
internationally recognized organizations including African Centre for 
Citizens Orientation, Pan African Institute for Entrepreneurship and 
Community Development, the Institution of Data Scientists and Analysts, 
Institute of Information Studies and Knowledge Management, Perry Olufemi 
Adeleye (SR) Institute of Agriculture, Technology and Transportation 
Engineering among others. He currently serves as the Head, Human 
Resources, Science and Technology (HRST) Cluster Committee, African Union 
Economic, Social and Cultural Council (AU ECOSOCC) Nigeria.

Common Sense that Guarantees Uncommon Success is a book divinely 
inspired to help people who want to succeed in life. It is full of timely 
instructions for those who want to accomplish their purpose on earth, while 
living a good and honest life without compromising their God-given purpose 
in any way. It contains tested secrets to living a successful life in all aspects.

It is a timely book placed in your hands to guide you on how to achieve your 
own kind of success. You don't have to look at another man's success to attain 
(measure) your true potential and you don't have to travel far or make 
retrospect to the past. You therefore can determine what you want and see 
how it aligns with God's purpose for your life as well as take actions to 
accomplish it. Everybody can become anything, but not all want to go through 
the process hence the many shortcuts people take to attain success. Your 
successes and accomplishments are in your story (pleasant or unpleasant) 
and if you cannot share your story with all sincerity, you are already a failure. 
Never make other peoples' successes as yardsticks for your own successes. 
Do all within your God-given resources and capacity to ful�ill destiny. This 
book will surely bless your life.
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